4/22/2017 Print

Subject: Re: Video Cam Files
From: Ty Clevenger (tyclevenger@yahoo.com)
To: citysecretary@cityofhearne.com;

Date: Saturday, April 22, 2017 10:56 AM

I was not referring to the dating of the personnel action form. I meant that because my
original public information request was submitted in March, the AG letter was untimely.
The AG needs to be informed that my original request was made in March, not on April 7.

From: Linda Pecina <citysecretary@cityofhearne.com>
To: Ty Clevenger <tyclevenger@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, April 21, 2017 6:23 PM

Subject: RE: Video Cam Files

Mr. Clevenger,

Ms. Tangerlia Felton-Taylor requested | send the information ‘registered”, to make sure you received it. | will be
happy to check on the priority tracking Monday morning since our post office closes at 4:30 p.m. daily. | just
want to make sure you receive it, and | have some kind of receipt for our files. As for payment, the City can take
payments over the phone.

Also, the City’s All Purpose Personnel Action Form was not dated until March 31, 2017. That is when Sgt.
Yohner was placed on Administrative Leave. | cannot send you what | did not have.

Have a good weekend.

Linda Pecina

City Secretary

City of Hearne

979/279-3461
citysecretary@cityofhearne.com

From: Ty Clevenger [mailto:tyclevenger@yahoo.com]
Sent: Friday, April 21, 2017 4:45 PM

To: Linda Pecina <citysecretary@cityofhearne.com>
Cc: tangerliafelton@aol.com

Subject: Re: Video Cam Files

Ms. Pecina,
If you send the CD via registered mail, it will not get here until too late. Please just send it Priority Mail,
which includes tracking. | should not be required to pay in advance. Instead, the charges should be

counted toward court costs. If you insist on pre-payment, please let me know how | can pay online.

Also, please let me know whether you intend to supplement your letter to the attorney general. Thank
you.
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4/22/2017 Print
Ty Clevenger

From: Linda Pecina <citysecretary@cityofhearne.com>
To: "tyclevenger@yahoo.com" <tyclevenger@yahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, April 21, 2017 5:39 PM

Subject: Video Cam Files

Mr. Clevenger,

Attorney Tangerlia Taylor-Felton has advised me that you requested a copy of the Hearne Police
Department body cam video files concerning Councilmember Jackson . There will be a $1 charge for
the cd plus $12.89 registered mail fee. This brings the total to $13.89. Please advise as to how you
wish to pay for this. Thank you for your prompt response.

Linda Pecina

City Secretary

City of Hearne

979/279-3461
citysecretary@cityofhearne.com
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